
  
 
 
Provisional resolution of the University of Lleida's grants for the requalification 
of the Spanish university system, for 2021-2023 

The resolution of 2nd July 2021 calls for grants for the requalification of the Spanish 
university system for 2021-2023, of the University of Lleida, in the following categories: 
Margarita Salas grants, grants for the requalification of university teaching staff and 
María Zambrano grants. 

By order of 2nd September 2021 the provisional list of admitted and excluded applicants 
from the call of the University of Lleida for Grants for the requalification of the Spanish 
university system for 2021-2023 was published. 

By resolution of 24th September 2021 the definitive list of admitted and excluded 
applicants, as well as the composition of the Evaluation Commission, of the call of the 
University of Lleida for Grants for the requalification of the Spanish university system 
for 2021-2023 was published. 

In accordance with the provisions of article 9 of the resolution of 2nd July 2021, this 
Rectorate resolves: 

FIRST: once the Evaluation Commission has been constituted and the evaluation of 
the admitted applications has been carried out, to publish the provisional resolution of 
the call of the University of Lleida for Grants for the requalification of the Spanish 
university system for 2021-2023. Annex 1 contains the provisional list of selected 
applications, Annex 2 contains the list of reserves and Annex 3 lists the candidates 
who have not reached the minimum score required. These lists will also be published in 
the UdL e-tauler. 

This publication replaces the individual notification, with the same effects, in 
accordance with the provisions of article 45.1b) of Law 39/2015, of 1st October, on the 
Common Administrative Procedure of Public Administrations. 

The Evaluation Commission lists in its reasoned report the list of prioritised applications 
considering 5 areas of knowledge, establishing a minimum of one selected candidate 
per area and assigning the rest according to the D'Hondt Law. 

In the event of resignations or withdrawals, the reserves of the area in which the 
withdrawal occurs will be substituted. If there are no reserves in that area, they will be 
substituted by the next selected application in another area, again applying the D'Hondt 
Law. 

SECOND: applicants have a period of ten working days, starting on the working day 
following the publication of this resolution, to submit their allegations. These allegations 
shall be submitted through the Electronic Register of the UdL. 

Pursuant to Article 112(1) of Law 39/2015, of 1 October, on the Common 
Administrative Procedure for Public Administrations, no appeal may be lodged against 
this decision. 

 
 
 
Jaume Puy Llorens 
Rector of the University of Lleida 

 

 



  
 
 

 

ANNEX 1 

MODALITY 1. MARGARITA SALAS 

PROVISIONAL LIST OF SELECTED APPLICATIONS 

APPLICANT  TOTAL 

Arts and humanities  

RIBEIRO TOSTES, ROGERIO 97 

RAMON MOLINS, GABRIEL 95 

GUTIÉRREZ UJAQUE, DANIEL 89.5 

Agri-food sciences  

LÓPEZ GÁMEZ, GLORIA MARÍA 98 

NICOLAU LAPEÑA, IOLANDA 95 

YUSTE PÉREZ, SILVIA 86 

CLEMENTE ORTA, GEMMA MARIA 85 

BASAVARADDI, PRIYANKA ANANTARADDI 84 

MARTÍNEZ SUBIRÀ, MARIONA 80 

Health sciences  

TORRES CABESTANY, PASCUAL 87.5 

CLIMENT SANZ, CAROLINA 87 

Legal and social sciences  

DE PANO RODRÍGUEZ, ÁLVARO 93 

PRESTA NOVELLO, DÉBORAH 90 

SOLÉ LLUSSÀ, ANNA 90 

Architecture and engineering  

VILARRUBÍ PORTA, MONTSERRAT 90.9 

  

 
MODALITY 2. REQUALIFICATION 

PROVISIONAL LIST OF SELECTED APPLICATIONS 

APPLICANT  TOTAL 

Arts and humanities  

BOUSO GARCIA, MÒNICA 81 

Architecture and engineering  

ÁLVAREZ RODRÍGUEZ, JAVIER 95.5 

PLANES CID, JORDI 92.5 

MATEU PIÑOL, CARLES 90 

RINCÓN VILLAREAL, LIDIA 87 

MATEO FORNES, JORDI 86 

 

 



  
 
 

 

MODALITY 3. MARIA ZAMBRANO 

 

PROVISIONAL LIST OF SELECTED APPLICATIONS 

APPLICANT  TOTAL 

Arts and humanities  

NADALUTTI, ELISABETTA 99 

Agri-food sciences  

ROJAS CAÑADAS, EBER 98 

ALCASENA URDIROZ, FERMÍN 96 

CARRERA, CONSTANZA SOLEDAD 96 

BRATKIC, ARNE 94 

Health sciences  

USIÉ CHIMENOS, ANA ISABEL 84 

Legal and social sciences  

CORTINA ORIOL, MERCÈ 96 

Architecture and engineering  

DOS REIS MORGADO, ANTONIO JOSÉ 92 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



  
 
 

 

ANNEX 2 

MODALITY 1.  MARGARITA SALAS 

PROVISIONAL LIST OF APPLICATIONS IN RESERVE 

APPLICANT  TOTAL 

Arts and humanities  

ESTEBAN OLIVER, GUILLERMO 80.5 

Health sciences  

BRITTI, ELENA 82.5 

Legal and social sciences  

CURTO REVERTE, ANDREU 87 

PARISI MORENO, VERÓNICA 83 

ÁLVAREZ JUSTEL, JOSEFINA 80 

Architecture and engineering  

CARBAJO GARCIA, RUTH 84.25 

  

 
MODALITY 2. REQUALIFICATION 

PROVISIONAL LIST OF APPLICATIONS IN RESERVE 

APPLICANT TOTAL 

Architecture and engineering  

VILAPLANA MAYORAL, JORDI 84 

 

MODALITY 3. MARIA ZAMBRANO 

 

PROVISIONAL LIST OF APPLICATIONS IN RESERVE 

APPLICANT  TOTAL 

Arts and humanities  

RUCHESI, FERNANDO CARLOS 97 

SOLER CARBONELL, JOSEP 91 

MORCUENDE GONZÁLEZ, ALEJANDRO 83 

Agri-food sciences  

ARMENGOT MARTÍNEZ, LAURA 93 

SANTOS COSTA MONTERIO, ADNIVIA 92 

FORCINA, GIOVANNI 82 

Legal and social sciences  

REYES ANGONA, SERGIO 95 

ORELLANA HERNÁNDEZ, MARTHA LUCÍA 88 

Architecture and engineering  

LUCIANO, GIUSEPPE GAETANO  87 



  
 
 

 

ANNEX 3 

 

MODALITY 1. MARGARITA SALAS 

RELACIÓN PROVISIONAL DE SOLICITUDESPROVISIONAL LIST OF 
APPLICATIONS THAT HAVE NOT EXCEEDED THE MINIMUM MARK  

APPLICANT  TOTAL 

Arts and humanities  

BORRAS ANDRES, JUDIT 78 

MONCADA COMAS, BALBINA 77.5 

Agri-food sciences  

GENÉ MOLA, JORDI 79 

BATUECAS HUERTAS, IVÁN 73 

ORTIZ SOLÀ, JORDI 72 

COSTA ROURA SANDRA 70 

HAIDOULIS OCAMPOS, JUAN FRANCISO 54 

Health sciences  

BEÀ TÀRREGA, AIDA 65 

  

 
MODALITY 3. MARIA ZAMBRANO 

 

PROVISIONAL LIST OF APPLICATIONS THAT HAVE NOT EXCEEDED THE 
MINIMUM MARK 

APPLICANT  TOTAL 

Agri-food sciences  

PIQUÉ ALTES, GEMMA 74 

Architecture and engineering  

GONZÁLEZ CAPDEVILA, MARC  74 

 


